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ANSON MILLS

Essential All-Butter Pastry 2.1

Yield
One 9-inch pie crust or one 9- to 10-inch tart crust

Time
About 40 minutes to make the dough (including 30 minutes to chill the butter), 2 to 24 hours to
chill the dough, and about 35 minutes to roll it out and bake

Baking Notes
European-style butter, which has a higher fat percentage than average butter is absolutely
essential to the success of this recipe.

This recipe does require freezing and processing the butter in two batches—but it’s neat and
clean. The first round of butter is run with the flour to a fine pebbly particle size; the second
round is pulsed to larger chunks. Ice water goes right down the tube as the machine runs. This
dough will not chase itself around the blade. Rather, it remains relatively dry, succumbing to
pressure from a squeeze in the fist. You will actually be able to grasp when the dough has
acquired sufficient moisture. If the dough does not hold together, toss in additional ice water,
drop by drop. Weather, time of year, the condition of your flour—these are all factors that can
influence hydration requirements. Once rested, the dough will be completely hydrated.

Roll the dough out when it is malleable, but still very chilled, between sheets of parchment
paper. Use as little additional flour as possible. A pizza stone or baking steel will produce a
superior bottom crust. Please use one for best results.

Equipment Mise en Place

To make the pastry, you will need a digital kitchen scale, two small bowls, two liquid measuring
cups, a food processor, a large bowl, plastic wrap, parchment paper, a rolling pin, a ruler, a
9-inch pie plate or a 9- to 10-inch tart pan with a removable bottom, a pizza stone or baking
steel, aluminum foil, and 2 to 3 cups of pie weights.

Ingredients

4.5 ounces cold unsalted European-style butter, cut into %2-inch cubes

A handful of ice cubes

Spring or filtered water

5.5 ounces Anson Mills Colonial Style Fine Cloth-Bolted Pastry Flour, frozen, plus additional
for rolling out the dough

1 ounce Anson Mills French Mediterranean White Bread Flour, frozen

Scant %2 teaspoon fine sea salt
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Directions
1. Divide the butter between two small bowls, one with 2.5 ounces of butter, the other with
2 ounces. Cover each bowl with plastic wrap and place them in the freezer for 30 minutes.

2. When the butter is frozen, drop the ice cubes into a liquid measuring cup, fill the cup with
water, and set it aside. In a food processor, pulse the flours and salt a couple of times to
combine. Scatter the larger amount of chilled butter over the flour mixture and pulse until the
butter pieces are fine-ish and the mixture looks pebbly, about ten 1-second pulses. Scatter the
remaining butter over the flour-butter mixture and pulse until the butter is combined but still
bears Y4-inch chunks, about five 1-second pulses. Set a second liquid measuring cup on a digital
kitchen scale, tare the scale, and weigh out 2 ounces of ice water, taking only the water and none
of the ice; reserve the remaining ice water. With the machine running, pour the ice water
through the feed tube and process for just 2 to 3 seconds more. The crumbs will look fine and
granular and the butter will be in fine bits, but the mixture will not have come together into a
cohesive dough.

3. Turn the contents of the food processor into a large bowl and squeeze some of the crumbs
in your palm—they should hold together but not feel damp. If they do not hold together,
sprinkle on a drop or two more of ice water over and fluff the mixture with your fingers to
incorporate. Test the mixture once again and fluff in additional water, if needed—but no more
than 1 teaspoon additional water should be required.

4. Lay a large sheet of plastic wrap on the counter. With the dough mixture still in the bowl, use
your hands to squeeze it into a mound. Set the mound on the plastic, leaving the crumbs and

bits behind. Press and squeeze the mound into a compact disk, adding and pressing the crumbs
into the mass. Wrap tightly in the plastic, then refrigerate for at least 2 hours or up to overnight.

5. Unwrap the dough, place it on a lightly floured sheet of parchment paper and flour the dough
lightly. Pound it with a rolling pin to flatten it slightly, retaining its shape. Lay a second
parchment sheet on top. Using the rolling pin, roll out the dough to a 12-inch round,
occasionally flipping it in its parchment sandwich and lifting the paper to prevent the dough
from sticking. Lightly flour the rolling pin, wrap the dough around it, then unroll the dough onto
a 9-inch pie pan or a 9- to 10-inch tart pan with a removable bottom. Lift the edges of the dough
and ease it into the corners of the pan. If using a pie pan, trim the edges, then crimp or flute
them; if using a tart pan, gently press the dough into the fluted sides of the pan, then use a
paring knife to trim the excess dough so that the edge is flush with the rim of the pan. With a
fork, poke evenly spaced sets of holes in the bottom of the dough. Refrigerate the dough-lined
pan until the dough is firm, at least 1 hour or up to 2 hours. Adjust an oven rack to the lowest
position. Place a pizza stone or baking steel on the rack and heat the oven to 400 degrees; allow
the stone or steel to heat for at least 1 hour.

6. Line the chilled dough-lined pan with a sheet of aluminum foil, allowing ample overhang.
Pour 2 to 3 cups of pie weights into the foil. Slide the pan directly onto the pizza stone and bake
for 25 minutes. Carefully remove the pan from the oven, lift out the foil and weights, and return
the pan to the pizza stone. Continue to bake until the pastry is golden brown, about 5 minutes.
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